2020 Bituminous Materials Bids

Bid Opening: March 26, 2020 at 10:30 AM

Bidder: Asphalt Materials, Inc.

. Unit Price | Unit Price
Grade Cuantity Pick-Up Delivered
MWS 90 185,000 Gal. $1.55 $1.54
RS 2P 5,000 Gal. $1.75 $1.85
SS1H (tack coat) 5,000 Gal. $1.95 $2.05
Trackless tack 5,000 Gal. $2.00 $2.10
SS1H - diluted (fog seal) 20,000 Gal. $1.25 $1.35
Bidder: K-Tech Specialty Coatings
: Unit Price | Unit Price
rade Quaritity Pick-Up Delivered
MWS 90 185,000 Gal. $1.68 $1.78
RS 2P 5,000 Gal. $1.68 $1.78
SS1H (tack coat) 5,000 Gal. No Bid No Bid
Trackless tack 5,000 Gal. $2.20 $2.30
SS1H - diluted (fog seal) (20,000 Gal. No Bid No Bid
Bidder:
. Unit Price | Unit Price
Grade Quantity Pick-Up Delivered
MWS 90 185,000 Gal.
RS 2P 5,000 Gal.
SS1H (tack coat) 5,000 Gal.
Trackless tack 5,000 Gal.
SS1H - diluted (fog seal) 20,000 Gal.






