South Powell Creek #790

Palmer & Monroe Townships, Putnam County Ohio
Maintenance Clean Out

QUOTE FOR MAINTENANCE

I wish to submit the following quote for furnishing of all labor, materials and
equipment to complete the construction of the South Powell Creek #790. This
project will be completed under the County Maintenance Program.

The work will include:

Item # 1 — Cleanout the open ditch to its original bottom
and grade to the full width of the existing channel
from the Top End to Road 19. (Equipment & Labor)

30,605 lineal feet of excavation @ $ 0.70 /ft. =5 Q& -_{bw Y

Item # 2 — Haul spoil from house lots and level all excavated material
along the ditch to a maximum depth of six inches.
(Equipment & Labor)

*All landowners who request no leveling must be in
contact with the Engineer’s Office before approval.

30,605 lineal feet of leveling @ $ 0. ] O /ft. =$32.060.50

Item # 3 — Clearing consisting of removal of trees, brush,
stumps, snags and debris from the construction side only.
(One Sided) Isolated trees that would not impede the
construction may be saved upon landowners request. Pile
all brush for landowners disposal. (Equipment & Labor)

Clearing & Piling Brush — Lump Sum -$ 8 \000.”

Item # 4 — Clean material out of all pipes and bridges.
Every pipe cleaning will have a separate lump
sum price. Final inspection and approval will be
upon the Engineer’s Office. (Equipment & Labor)

11910 Properties — (40Ft. of (2) 24” Plastic Pipes) =$ w 58, =
Road 15-C Pipe — (48 Ft. of 78” R.C.P.) -5 350.~
Road 16 Pipe — (40 Ft. of 84” R.C.P. Plastic) =$ 350. = 748
Road 16-C Pipe — (40 Ft. 108” R.C.P.) -5 350." i
Darwin Verhoff Pipe — (45 Ft. of 108” Corrugated Metal)  =$ E Sb. ol
SR 613 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge) —$ 500,
Kahle/Verhoff — (12 Ft. of Bridge) 3 300."
Rail Road Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge) —s 500.
Road E-16 Bridge — (32 Ft. of Bridge) 5 S00.”
St. Rt. 15 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge) =$ S00. il
Road 18 Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge) -3 500,
e

Road 19 Bridge — (38 Ft. of Bridge) -$ 500.



Item # 5 — Remove log jams and silt bars from the channel bottom from
Township Road 19 to Township Road C-20. Pile all
wooded material for landowner’s disposal or level excavated
material to a minimum of 6 inches.
*Number of hours for silt bar and log jam removal may increase
or decrease. Quoted price per hour will be used.

(Equipment & Labor)
prm
(20) Hrs Log Jam Removal — Price per hour = ~ m 5

TOTAL QUOTE  =$.37,534. =

)
mL 'S m_nzzci\\!
N_Q.m 42 S+ B 190 DATE:_[3-&- ]9
r JENnieeS OH  pHONE: U19- 986 -24S3

The completion date for this project is April 30th, 2019.

The County Engineer reserves the right to non-perform bidded items.
Please submit your quote to the Putnam County Engineer, 245 E Main St.,
Ottawa, Ohio 45875 in a sealed envelope marked “Quote on South Powell
Creek #790” by 10:00 A.M. on December 9™, 2019. No bid bond or deposit
required.

Note —

After the County Engineer awards the lowest and best quote, a contract will
need signed in the Engineer’s Office before starting. Once signed, there will be a
pre-construction meeting before excavation begins. — See “Information to
bidders for petition ditches” sheet attached along with this quote.




South Powell Creek #790

Palmer & Monroe Townships, Putnam County Ohio
Maintenance Clean Out

QUOTE FOR MAINTENANCE

I wish to submit the following quote for furnishing of all labor, materials and
equipment to complete the construction of the South Powell Creek #790. This
project will be completed under the County Maintenance Program.

The work will include:

Item # 1 — Cleanout the open ditch to its original bottom
and grade to the full width of the existing channel
from the Top End to Road 19. (Equipment & Labor)

30,605 lineal feet of excavation @ $_, 15 /ft. =$_272, 963.15

Item # 2 — Haul spoil from house lots and level all excavated material
along the ditch to a maximum depth of six inches.
(Equipment & Labor)

*All landowners wh SRR G S kein
contact with the En

30,605 lineal feet of le 2: *w%. du\ =$_15, 302.50
Item # 3 — Clearing consisting
stumps, snags and only.
(One Sided) Isolat 5
constructionmay b ... ___ . . Pile

all brush for landowners disposal. (Equipment & Labor)

Clearing & Piling Brush — Lump Sum =5 & &. 000.00

Item # 4 — Clean material out of all pipes and bridges.
Every pipe cleaning will have a separate lump
sum price. Final inspection and approval will be
upon the Engineer’s Office. (Equipment & Labor)

11910 Properties — (40Ft. of (2) 24” Plastic Pipes) =$  559.90 o
Road 15-C Pipe — (48 Ft. of 78” R.C.P.) =$_S5Sv.00 I
Road 16 Pipe — (40 Ft. of 84” R.C.P. Plastic) =$_8§©0.00

Road 16-C Pipe — (40 Ft. 108” R.C.P.) =$_ Sovw.00 1500
Darwin Verhoff Pipe — (45 Ft. of 108” Corrugated Metal) =$ S©o. 0o

SR 613 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge) = 450.00 150
Kahle/Verhoff — (12 Ft. of Bridge) =§ 30v.00

Rail Road Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge) = LYSv.00

Road E-16 Bridge — (32 Ft. of Bridge) =$ Yso.00

St. Rt. 15 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge) =$__Yso0.00 4450
Road 18 Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge) =$  YSu.00

Road 19 Bridge — (38 Ft. of Bridge) =g “{59.09



Item # 5 — Remove log jams and silt bars from the channel bottom from
Township Road 19 to Township Road C-20. Pile all
wooded material for landowner’s disposal or level excavated
material to a minimum of 6 inches.
*Number of hours for silt bar and log jam removal may increase
or decrease. Quoted price per hour will be used.
(Equipment & Labor)

(20) Hrs Log Jam Removal — Price per hour =$ N 50,00

TOTAL QUOTE  =$_7(,5%6.25
CONTRACTORS SIGNATURE: § &{ 4% mw . 4 0
]

ADDRESS: bS7. TK o7 DATE: ||-2
Mclomb, 0o Yss5%  prONE:__ 14

The completion date for this project is April 30th, 2019.

The County Engineer reserves the right to non-perform bidded items.
Please submit your quote to the Putnam County Engineer, 245 E Main St.,
Ottawa, Ohio 45875 in a sealed envelope marked “Quote on South Powell
Creek #790” by 10:00 A.M. on December 9™, 2019. No bid bond or deposit
required.

Note —

After the County Engineer awards the lowest and best quote, a contract will
need signed in the Engineer’s Office before starting. Once signed, there will be a
pre-construction meeting before excavation begins. — See “Information to
bidders for petition ditches™ sheet attached along with this quote.




South Powell Creek #790

Palmer & Monroe Townships, Putnam County Ohio
Maintenance Clean Out

QUOTE FOR MAINTENANCE

I wish to submit the following quote for furnishing of all labor, materials and
equipment to complete the construction of the South Powell Creek #790. This
project will be completed under the County Maintenance Program.

The work will include:
Item # 1 — Cleanout the open ditch to its original bottom

and grade to the full width of the existing channel
from the Top End to Road 19. (Equipment & Labor)

30,605 lineal feet of excavation @ §_» ( 25 .

Item # 2 — Haul spoil from house lots and level all excavated material
along the ditch to a maximum depth of six inches.

(Equipment & Labor)
FAW landowners who request no leveling )
contact with the Engincer’s Office before approy al.

i T
30,605 lineal feet of leveling @ $ AL 5 1285 N\m 0

Item # 3 — Clearing consisting of removal of trees, brush,
stumps, snags and debris from the construction side only.
(One Sided) Isolated trees that would not impede the
construction may be saved upon landowners request. Pile
all brush for landowners disposal. (Equipment & Labor)

Clearing & Piling Brush — Lump Sum Hw\g

Item # 4 — Clean material out of all pipes and bridges.
Every pipe cleaning will have a separate lump
sum price. Final inspection and approval will be
upon the Engineer’s Office. (Equipment & Labor)

11910 Properties — (40Ft. of (2) 24” Plastic Pipes) =3 h\%@ 13
Road 15-C Pipe — (48 Ft. of 78” R.C.P.) s 575 .
Road 16 Pipe — (40 Ft. of 84” R.C.P. Plastic) =$_ 480 a5
Road 16-C Pipe — (40 Ft. 108” R.C.P.) =$_4#0

Darwin Verhoff Pipe — (45 Ft. of 108” Corrugated Metal) =$ S50 97
SR 613 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge) =$ 4AS
Kahle/Verhoff — (12 Ft. of Bridge) =5 m.wu@ 116
Rail Road Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge) =$_4%0

Road E-16 Bridge — (32 Ft. of Bridge) =5 RO 240
St. Rt. 15 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge) -5 L

Road 18 Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge) -5 48P 200

Road 19 Bridge — (38 F. of Bridge) =5 UYgb



Item # 5 — Remove log jams and silt bars from the channel bottom from
Township Road 19 to Township Road C-20. Pile all
wooded material for landowner’s disposal or level excavated
material to a B::EE: om 6 Eormm

*Number of hou jam removal may increasc
or decrease. Quoted price per hour will |
(Equipment & Labor)

Y 9
(20) Hrs Log Jam Removal — Price per hour =$ @

55
sy1.50

TOTAL QUOTE =
CONTRACTORS m~02>ﬂdwmf§ §\

ADDRESS: ___ NWO Property Services LLC DATE: mm ~]-/ %
3939 North West St

Lima Oh. 45801 PHONE: 4[4 -LelS 25 vm

g T,.:r( i ,,,., U 019,

The County Enginecr reserves the yivht to noy-perform bidded items,
Please submit your quote to the Putnam County Engineer, 245 E Main St.,
Ottawa, Ohio 45875 in a sealed envelope marked “Quote on South Powell
Creek #790” by 10:00 A.M. on December 9™, 2019. No bid bond or deposit
required.

Note —

After the County Engineer awards the lowest and best quote, a contract will
need signed in the Engineer’s Office before starting. Once signed, there will be a
pre-construction meeting before excavation begins. — See “Information to
bidders for petition ditches™ sheet attached along with this quote.

I'he completion date for t




South Powell Creek #790

Palmer & Monroe Townships, Putnam County Ohio
Maintenance Clean Out

QUOTE FOR MAINTENANCE

I wish to submit the following quote for furnishing of all labor, materials and
equipment to complete the construction of the South Powell Creek #790. This
project will be completed under the County Maintenance Program.

The work will include:

Item # 1 — Cleanout the open ditch to its original bottom
and grade to the full width of the existing channel
from the Top End to Road 19. (Equipment & Labor)

30,605 lLineal feet of excavation @ $_/- /O /ft. =3 33,658, 50

Item # 2 — Haul spoil from house lots and level all excavated material
along the ditch to a maximum depth of six inches.
(Equipment & Labor)

*All landowners who request no leveling must be in
contact with the Engineer’s Office before approval.

30,605 lineal feet of levelng @ §_- 235 in, ¢ 765/-2 =2

Item # 3 — Clearing consisting of removal of trees, brush,
stumps, snags and debris from the construction side only.
(One Sided) Isolated trees that would not impede the
construction may be saved upon landowners request. Pile
all brush for landowners disposal. (Equipment & Labor)

Clearing & Piling Brush — Lump Sum =3 8ooo, o°

Item # 4 — Clean material out of all pipes and bridges.
Every pipe cleaning will have a separate lump
sum price. Final inspection and approval will be
upon the Engineer’s Office. (Equipment & Labor)

11910 Properties — (40Ft. of (2) 24” Plastic Pipes) =§ L00.0c -
Road 15-C Pipe — (48 Ft. of 78” R.C.P.) =$_ /b6 , 00
Road 16 Pipe — (40 Ft. of 84” R.C.P. Plastic) =$_/00. 00
Road 16-C Pipe — (40 Ft. 108” R.C.P) - /00.00 1
Darwin Verhoff Pipe — (45 Ft. of 108” Corrugated Metal) =$ /00 ©0

SR 613 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge) =$_«00.00 _
Kahle/Verhoff — (12 Ft. of Bridge) =$ /po.00 "
Rail Road Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge) =§ 400.00
Road E-16 Bridge — (32 Ft. of Bridge) =§ 400.00

St. Rt. 15 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge) =§ 4#p0.00 %%
Road 18 Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge) =§ #vo-0O

Road 19 Bridge — (38 Ft. of Bridge) = <60.00O



Item # 5 — Remove log jams and silt bars from the channel bottom from
Township Road 19 to Township Road C-20. Pile all
wooded material for landowner’s disposal or level excavated
material to a minimum of 6 inches.
*Number of hours for silt bar and log jam removal may increase
or decrease. Quoted price per hour will be used.
(Equipment & Labor)

(20) Hrs Log Jam Removal — Price per hour = /S0.00

TOTAL QUOTE =$ SR2,¥06.75

AN

15 Fawnang Sxe, (L ¢

55 46.

co! d \m\&\x\%\\&i\b\«

ADD Fﬁm )2-2-/9
peDNLER ol PHONE: 4 F ~E73 ~0278

The completion date for this project is April 30th, 2019.
The County Engineer reserves the right to non-perform bidded items.
Please submit your quote to the Putnam County Engineer, 245 E Main St.,
Ottawa, Ohio 45875 in a sealed envelope marked “Quote on South Powell
Creek #790” by 10:00 A.M. on December 9, 2019. No bid bond or deposit
required.
Note —
After the County Engineer awards the lowest and best quote, a contract will
need signed in the Engineer’s Office before starting. Once signed, there will be a
pre-construction meeting before excavation begins. — See “Information to
bidders for petition ditches” sheet attached along with this quote.




South Powell Creek #790

Palmer & Monroe Townships, Putnam County Ohio
Maintenance Clean Out

QUOTE FOR MAINTENANCE

I wish to submit the following quote for furnishing of all labor, materials and
equipment to complete the construction of the South Powell Creek #790. This
project will be completed under the County Maintenance Program.

The work will include:

Item # 1 — Cleanout the open ditch to its original bottom
and grade to the full width of the existing channel
from the Top End to Road 19. (Equipment & Labor)

30,605 lineal feet of excavation @ $ [ mv /t. =5 wm\ (l W 10

Item # 2 — Haul spoil from house lots and level all excavated material
along the ditch to a maximum depth of six inches.
(Equipment & Labor)

*All landowners who request no leveling must be in
contact with the Engineer’s Office before approval

30,605 lineal feet of leveling @ $.0 54 . =5 18,05 3

Item # 3 — Clearing consisting of removal of trees, brush,
stumps, snags and debris from the construction side only.
(One Sided) Isolated trees that would not impede the
construction may be saved upon landowners request. Pile
all brush for landowners disposal. (Equipment & Labor)

Clearing & Piling Brush — Lump Sum =% wmg

Item # 4 — Clean material out of all pipes and bridges.
Every pipe cleaning will have a separate lump
sum price. Final inspection and approval will be
upon the Engineer’s Office. (Equipment & Labor)

11910 Properties — (40Ft. of (2) 24” Plastic Pipes) =$ @8

Road 15-C Pipe — (48 Ft. of 78” R.C.P.) s 500

Road 16 Pipe — (40 Ft. of 84” R.C.P. Plastic) =5 o0

Road 16-C Pipe — (40 Ft. 108” R.C.P.) =3 OO 029
Darwin Verhoff Pipe — (45 Ft. of 108” Corrugated Metal) =$ _ No &'

SR 613 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge) =5 500D
Kahle/Verhoff — (12 Ft. of Bridge) = 500

Rail Road Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge) =5 500

Road E-16 Bridge — (32 Ft. of Bridge) 5 500 g7
St. Rt. 15 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge) =5 500

Road 18 Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge) s 500

Road 19 Bridge — (38 Ft. of Bridge) - 500




Item # 5 — Remove log jams and silt bars from the channel bottom from
Township Road 19 to Township Road C-20. Pile all
wooded material for landowner’s disposal or level excavated
material to a minimum of 6 inches.
*Number of hours for silt bar and log jam removal may increase
or decrease. Quoted price per hour will be used.
(Equipment & Labor)

(20) Hrs Log Jam Removal — Price per —:::.k\ m;o =$ F\M%
77, 27085
TOTAL QUOTE =$ 1%

CONTRACTORS m~®2>ﬁd-m"<&¢§ §

aooress: 1787 (o RpD DATE: |2-4-11
ARCHABROLD ot Y255T pronE: 419 572 405 7

The completion date for this project is April 30th, 2019.

The County Engineer reserves the right to non-perform bidded items.
Please submit your quote to the Putnam County Engineer, 245 E Main St.,
Ottawa, Ohio 45875 in a sealed envelope marked “Quote on South Powell
Creek #790” by 10:00 A.M. on December 9, 2019. No bid bond or deposit
required.

Note —

After the County Engineer awards the lowest and best quote, a contract will
need signed in the Engineer’s Office before starting. Once signed, there will be a
pre-construction meeting before excavation begins. — See “Information to
bidders for petition ditches™” sheet attached along with this quote.




South Powell Creek #790

Palmer & Monroe Townships, Putnam County Ohio
Maintenance Clean Out

QUOTE FOR MAINTENANCE

I wish to submit the following quote for furnishing of all labor, materials and
equipment to complete the construction of the South Powell Creek #790. This
project will be completed under the County Maintenance Program.

The work will include:

Item # 1 — Cleanout the open ditch to its original bottom
and grade to the full width of the existing channel
from the Top End to Road 19. (Equipment & Labor)

~ (O zj 7
30,605 lineal feet of excavation @ $ o M\, ] /. = H u, / J H\u J

Item # 2 — Haul spoil from house lots and level all excavated material
along the ditch to a maximum depth of six inches.
(Equipment & Labor)

* All landowners who request no leveling must be in
contact with the Engineer’s Office before approval.

~ =7 O

30,605 lineal feet of leveling @ $ » J [ =$ J

ok

e/

|

Item # 3 — Clearing consisting of removal of trees, brush,
stumps, snags and debris from the construction side only.
(One Sided) Isolated trees that would not impede the
construction may be saved upon landowners request. Pile
all brush for landowners disposal. (Equipment & Labor)

Clearing & Piling Brush — Lump Sum

Item # 4 — Clean material out of all pipes and bridges.
Every pipe cleaning will have a separate lump
sum price. Final inspection and approval will be
upon the Engineer’s Office. (Equipment & Labor)

11910 Properties — (40Ft. of (2) 24” Plastic Pipes)

Road 15-C Pipe — (48 Ft. of 78” R.C.P.)

Road 16 Pipe — (40 Ft. of 84” R.C.P. Plastic)

Road 16-C Pipe — (40 Ft. 108” R.C.P.)

Darwin Verhoff Pipe — (45 Ft. of 108” Corrugated Metal) =$_ b /9

SR 613 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge) s _/0(
Kahle/Verhoff — (12 Ft. of Bridge) 5 1&C
Rail Road Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge) -5 oC(

Road E-16 Bridge — (32 Ft. of Bridge) s LH0
St. Rt. 15 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge)

Road 18 Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge)

Road 19 Bridge — (38 Ft. of Bridge)



Item # 5 — Remove log jams and silt bars from the channel bottom from
Township Road 19 to Township Road C-20. Pile all
wooded material for landowner’s disposal or level excavated
material to a minimum of 6 inches.
*Number of hours for silt bar and log jam removal may increase
or decrease. Quoted price per hour will be used.
(Equipment & Labor)

(20) Hrs Log Jam Removal — Price per hour

\~\e ._\ L TOTAL QUOTE

~ i 7
45, 741. 35 B &@T\r el ?Thmw\ .

oS T pate: 13§17
(NN i P N G5
Utfews  pal pHONE: 11915~ 3053

The completion date for this project is April 30th, 2019.

The County Engineer reserves the right to non-perform bidded items.
Please submit your quote to the Putnam County Engineer, 245 E Main St.,
Ottawa, Ohio 45875 in a sealed envelope marked “Quote on South Powell
Creek #790” by 10:00 A.M. on December 9™, 2019. No bid bond or deposit
required.

Note —

After the County Engineer awards the lowest and best quote, a contract will
need signed in the Engineer’s Office before starting. Once signed, there will be a
pre-construction meeting before excavation begins. — See “Information to
bidders for petition ditches” sheet attached along with this quote.




South Powell Creek #790

Palmer & Monroe Townships, Putnam County Ohio
Maintenance Clean Out

QUOTE FOR MAINTENANCE

I wish to submit the following quote for furnishing of all labor, materials and
equipment to complete the construction of the South Powell Creek #790. This
project will be completed under the County Maintenance Program.

The work will include:

Item # 1 — Cleanout the open ditch to its original bottom
and grade to the full width of the existing channel
from the Top End to Road 19. (Equipment & Labor)

30,605 lineal feet of excavation @ §$_« 70 . =$ Q\N\‘ 4R 3. 50

Item # 2 — Haul spoil from house lots and level all excavated material
along the ditch to a maximum depth of six inches.
(Equipment & Labor)

1 Tandowners who request no leveling must be in

contact with the Engineer’s Office before approval.

30,605 lineal feet of leveling @ $_+ &0 /ft. =$ & /3R oo

Item # 3 — Clearing consisting of removal of trees, brush,
stumps, snags and debris from the construction side only.
(One Sided) Isolated trees that would not impede the
construction may be saved upon landowners request. Pile
all brush for landowners disposal. (Equipment & Labor)

Clearing & Piling Brush — Lump Sum =$ X ddo. €0
Lo DAy B

[tem # 4 — Clean material out of all pipes and bridges.
Every pipe cleaning will have a separate lump
sum price. Final inspection and approval will be
upon the Engineer’s Office. (Equipment & Labor)

11910 Properties — (40Ft. of (2) 24” Plastic Pipes) =$ L00, 00

Road 15-C Pipe — (48 Ft. of 78” R.C.P.) =$ o0, 00

Road 16 Pipe — (40 Ft. of 84” R.C.P. Plastic) =$ 0. 00 Eo@.
Road 16-C Pipe — (40 Ft. 108” R.C.P.) =$ (L oD.0d

Darwin Verhoff Pipe — (45 Ft. of 108” Corrugated Metal)  =$ M 0. o -

SR 613 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge) =$ /000, J0 -
Kahle/Verhoff — (12 Ft. of Bridge) = Q.00 -

Rail Road Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge) =$ /0. JO

Road E-16 Bridge — (32 Ft. of Bridge) =$ g . d0 .
St. Rt. 15 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge) =$ /, ddo, do £00°
Road 18 Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge) Hm“ 006 « 00

Road 19 Bridge — (38 Ft. of Bridge) =$_4d00. 00



Item # 5 — Remove log jams and silt bars from the channel bottom from
Township Road 19 to Township Road C-20. Pile all
wooded material for landowner’s disposal or level excavated
material to a minimum of 6 inches.
Number of hours for silt bar and log jam removal may ing
r decrease. Quoted price per hour will be used.

. 3 {
(Equipment & Labor)

(20) Hrs Log Jam Removal — Price per hour /50.9¢ =8 3 000, 0O

TOTAL QUOTE =8 ¥ %% 50

Sand Ridae %\&\kw\\k‘

CONTRACTORS SIGNATURK: A .
ADDRESS: U35/ Fd T-17 DATE: /2~ /Y
\4 \S\,\\Sm\\w . R\%\&H\N\\ PHONE: 4/G-S% L —5 2 g&

EER G 1S DI i \ 1 P oof

! hit to non-perform bidded items
Please submit your quote to the Putnam County Engineer, 245 E Main St.,
Ottawa, Ohio 45875 in a sealed envelope marked “Quote on South Powell
Creek #790” by 10:00 A.M. on December 9™, 2019. No bid bond or deposit
required.

Note -

After the County Engineer awards the lowest and best quote, a contract will

need signed in the Engineer’s Office before starting. Once signed, there will be a
pre-construction meeting before excavation begins. — See “Information to
bidders for petition ditches” sheet attached along with this quote.

Lo » Fasand ; pedvsloy o
The € Erne rres ¢ rieht fo




South Powell Creek #790

Palmer & Monroe Townships, Putnam County Ohio
Maintenance Clean Out

QUOTE FOR MAINTENANCE

I wish to submit the following quote for furnishing of all labor, materials and
equipment to complete the construction of the South Powell Creek #790. This
project will be completed under the County Maintenance Program.

The work will include:

Item # 1 — Cleanout the open ditch to its original bottom
and grade to the full width of the existing channel
from the Top End to Road 19. (Equipment & Labor)

e N i,z &
30,605 lineal feet of excavation @ § - 9 /. =$ \.ﬁ « @\h&. 50

Item # 2 — Haul spoil from house lots and level all excavated material
along the ditch to a maximum depth of six inches.
(Equipment & Labor)

*All landowners who request no leveling must be in
contact with the Engineer’s Office before approval.

30,605 lineal feet of leveling @ $_v 5o . =5 / 5.302,50

[tem # 3 — Clearing consisting of removal of trees, brush,
stumps, snags and debris from the construction side only.
(One Sided) Isolated trees that would not impede the
construction may be saved upon landowners request. Pile
all brush for landowners disposal. (Equipment & Labor)

(= 7y
Clearing & Piling Brush — Lump Sum s /9, 050

Item # 4 — Clean material out of all pipes and bridges.
Every pipe cleaning will have a separate lump
sum price. Final inspection and approval will be
upon the Engineer’s Office. (Equipment & Labor)

11910 Properties — (40Ft. of (2) 24” Plastic Pipes)

Road 15-C Pipe — (48 Ft. of 78” R.C.P.)

Road 16 Pipe — (40 Ft. of 84” R.C.P. Plastic)

Road 16-C Pipe — (40 Ft. 108” R.C.P.)

Darwin Verhoff Pipe — (45 Ft. of 108” Corrugated Metal)

SR 613 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge)
Kahle/Verhoff — (12 Ft. of Bridge)
Rail Road Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge)
Road E-16 Bridge — (32 Ft. of Bridge)
St. Rt. 15 Bridge — (35 Ft. of Bridge)
Road 18 Bridge — (40 Ft. of Bridge)
Road 19 Bridge — (38 Ft. of Bridge)




[tem # 5 — Remove log jams and silt bars from the channel bottom from
Township Road 19 to Township Road C-20. Pile all
wooded material for landowner’s disposal or level excavated
material to a minimum of 6 inches.
*Number of hours for silt bar and log jam removal may increase
or decrease. Quoted price per hour will be used.
(Equipment & Labor)

(20) Hrs Log Jam Removal — Price per hour =

»
TOTAL QUOTE  =s$_//3.55/.—
CONTRACTORS SIGNATURE: \\N\w\&&\\\/\
. 7z )
ADDRESS: $5397 cr 17 DATE: /2-- 2 - /9

oAk _HArHor Oho¥a4y] pHONE: 4/ 7-351-0872

The completion date for this project is April 30th, 2019,

The County Engineer reserves the right to non-perform bidded items.
Please submit your quote to the Putnam County Engineer, 245 E Main St.,
Ottawa, Ohio 45875 in a sealed envelope marked “Quote on South Powell
Creek #790” by 10:00 A.M. on December 9%, 2019. No bid bond or deposit
required.

Note —

After the County Engineer awards the lowest and best quote, a contract will
need signed in the Engineer’s Office before starting. Once signed, there will be a
pre-construction meeting before excavation begins. — See “Information to
bidders for petition ditches” sheet attached along with this quote.




