John Askins #823

Union, Jackson, Jennings, Sugar Creek Townships, Putnam County Ohio
Maintenance Reconstruction

QUOTE FOR MAINTENANCE

I wish to submit the following quote for furnishing of all labor, materials and
equipment to complete the construction of the John Askins #823. This project
will be completed under the County Maintenance Program.

The work will include:

Item # 1 — Cleanout the open ditch to its original bottom
and grade to the full width of the existing
channel. (Equipment & Labor)

" Ie) v
14,918 lineal feet of excavation @ $ g 4 %{ /ft. =$ %Nb

Item # 3 — Haul spoil from house lots and level all excavated material
along the ditch to a maximum depth of six inches.
(Equipment & Labor)

YAl landoy ho re t no leveling
tactwith the Enginecr’s Office before approt

14,918 lineal feet of leveling @ $_« _ 4 /t. =$ HM:WWW@O&

Item # 3 — Clearing consisting of removal of trees, brush,
stumps, snags and debris from the construction side only.
Isolated trees that would not impede the construction
May be saved upon landowner’s request. Pile all
Brush for landowner’s disposal. (Equipment & Labor)

Clearing & Piling Brush — Lump Sum =$ _w v\ ~ _R

Item # 4 — Clean material out of all pipes and bridges.
Every pipe cleaning will have a separate lump
sum price. Final inspection and approval will be
upon the Engineer’s Office. (Equipment & Labor)

1) Wehri Farm Drive — (17 Ft. Long 11 Ft. Span) =3 g
2) County Road 19 — (56 Ft. of 87°x135” R.C.P) =3 V.M @@
3) Erhart Farm Drive — (28Ft. of 84” Boiler Pipe) =$ m @
4) Kahle Farm Drive — (16 Ft. Long 8 Ft. Span) =$ %_ Vi

A
5) Schulte Farm Drive — (26 Ft. Long 7°6” Span) =$ rw %@

6) County Road 19 — (64 Ft. of 12° By 14’ Box Culvert) =$ Mg

7) Township Road Q — (27 Ft. of 12’ By 14” Box Culvert) =$ /«Iwum mvw




8) County Road 19 — (61 Ft. of 90” C.M. ARCH ) =5 L&D

9) Inkrott Farm Drive — (16 Ft. of 48" Cast Iron) =3 @u& N
10) Luebrecht Farm Drive — (6 Ft. Long 11 Ft. Span) =3 %@@

11) Studebaker House Drive — (21 Ft. Long 10 Ft. Span) =§ %/99

12) County Road 19 — (64 Ft. of 84” C.M. ARCH) =$ mmw K )

13) Township Road R — (28 Ft. Long, 8’ By 10’ Box Culvert)=$ 80

14) County Road 19 — (42 Ft. of 60” R.C.P) =$ KM%

CONTRACTORS SIGNATURE:

ADDRESS:_NWO Property Services LLC DATE:_
3939 North West St.
Lima Oh. 45801 PHONE: +
1 ]

> completion date for this project is Api

The County Engincer reserves the right ro non-perform bii

Ottawa, Ohio 45875 in a sealed envelope marked “Quote on the

Please submit your quote to the Putnam County Engineer, 245 E \ N\ A ﬂ ~ . m\ 4

#823” by 10:00 A.M. on December 9%, 2019. No bid bond or d
Note —

After the County Engineer awards the lowest and best quote, a ¢
need signed in the Engineer’s Office before starting. Once signex
pre-construction meeting before excavation begins. — See “Infon
bidders for petition ditches” sheet attached along with this quote



John Askins #823

Union, Jackson, Jennings, Sugar Creek Townships, Putnam County Ohio
Maintenance Reconstruction

QUOTE FOR MAINTENANCE

I wish to submit the following quote for furnishing of all labor, materials and
equipment to complete the construction of the John Askins #823. This project
will be completed under the County Maintenance Program.

The work will include:

Item # 1 — Cleanout the open ditch to its original bottom
and grade to the full width of the existing
channel. (Equipment & Labor)

14,918 lineal feet of excavation @ $,69 __/ft. =3 m_No 4.90

Item # 3 — Haul spoil from house lots and level all excavated material
along the ditch to a maximum depth of six inches.
(Equipment & Labor)

*All landowners who request no leveling must be in
contact with the Engineer’s Office before approval.

14,918 lineal feet of leveling @ $_. 35 /ft. =3 5,221,30

Item # 3 — Clearing consisting of removal of trees, brush,
stumps, snags and debris from the construction side only.
Isolated trees that would not impede the construction
May be saved upon landowner’s request. Pile all
Brush for landowner’s disposal. (Equipment & Labor)

Clearing & Piling Brush — Lump Sum =$_1150.00

Item # 4 — Clean material out of all pipes and bridges.
Every pipe cleaning will have a separate lump
sum price. Final inspection and approval will be
upon the Engineer’s Office. (Equipment & Labor)

1) Wehri Farm Drive — (17 Ft. Long 11 Ft. Span) =3 mOG .00
2) County Road 19 — (56 Ft. of 877x135” R.C.P) =§ $§09.00
3) Erhart Farm Drive — (28Ft. of 84” Boiler Pipe) =$__300.00
4) Kahle Farm Drive — (16 Ft. Long 8 Ft. Span) =$_ 3ov.00

S) Schulte Farm Drive — (26 Ft. Long 7°6” Span) =§_3o00.00
6) County Road 19 — (64 Ft. of 12’ By 14’ Box Culvert) =$_Qo0o.00

7) Townshi — (27 Ft. of 12’ By 14’ Box Culvert) =$ $§00.00

900



8) County Road 19 — (61 Ft. of 90” C.M. ARCH ) =$_659.00

9) Inkrott Farm Drive — (16 Ft. of 48” Cast Iron) =$  200.00

10) Luebrecht Farm Drive — (6 Ft. Long 11 Ft. Span) =$ 190.00

11) Studebaker House Drive — (21 Ft. Long 10 Ft. Span) =3 300.00

12) County Road 19 — (64 Ft. of 84” C.M. ARCH) =$ mms.oo

13) Township Road R — (28 Ft. Long, 8’ By 10’ Box Culvert)=$ H$9.00

14) County Road 19 — (42 Ft. of 60” R.C.P) =$ 500.60

TOTAL QUOTE =$_20,92(,.z.0

CONTRACTORS SIGNATURE: § NR\I

ADDRESS: (61 T /02 DATE:_ ||-27-14

Mlomb, plio Ysesx  PHONE:_419- 30451y

The completion date for this project is April 1st, 2020.

The County Engineer reserves the right to non-perform bidded items.
Please submit your quote to the Putnam County Engineer, 245 E Main St.,
Ottawa, Ohio 45875 in a sealed envelope marked “Quote on the John Askins
#823” by 10:00 A.M. on December 9%, 2019. No bid bond or deposit required.
Note —

After the County Engineer awards the lowest and best quote, a contract will
need signed in the Engineer’s Office before starting. Once signed, there will be a
pre-construction meeting before excavation begins. — See “Information to
bidders for petition ditches™ sheet attached along with this quote.




John Askins #823

Union, Jackson, Jennings, Sugar Creek Townships, Putnam County Ohio
Maintenance Reconstruction

QUOTE FOR MAINTENANCE

I wish to submit the following quote for furnishing of all labor, materials and
equipment to complete the construction of the John Askins #823. This project
will be completed under the County Maintenance Program.

The work will include:

Item # 1 — Cleanout the open ditch to its original bottom
and grade to the full width of the existing
channel. (Equipment & Labor)

14,918 lineal feet of excavation @ $ o %m /ft. =$ _ l %q% ‘ NO& %

Item # 3 — Haul spoil from house lots and leve] all excavated material
along the ditch to a maximum depth of six inches.
(Equipment & Labor)

*All landowners who request no leveling must be in
contact with the Engineer’s Office before approval.

14,918 lineal feet of leveling @ $_. \N.@ /. =§ M~ _ N q o $
0O

Item # 3 — Clearing consisting of removal of trees, brush,
stumps, snags and debris from the construction side only.
Isolated trees that would not impede the construction
May be saved upon landowner’s request. Pile all
Brush for landowner’s disposal. (Equipment & Labor)

Clearing & Piling Brush — Lump Sum =$ ~ “OOO

Item # 4 — Clean material out of all pipes and bridges.
Every pipe cleaning will have a separate lump
sum price. Final inspection and approval will be
upon the Engineer’s Office. (Equipment & Labor)

1) Wehri Farm Drive — (17 Ft. Long 11 Ft. Span) =% OO

2) County Road 19 — (56 Ft. of 87”x135” R.C.P) =5 MQ@
3) Erhart Farm Drive — (28Ft. of 84” Boiler Pipe) =$ m o0

4) Kahle Farm Drive — (16 Ft. Long 8 Ft. Span) =3 «VOO
S) Schulte Farm Drive — (26 Ft. Long 7°6” Span) =$ 1 6 O
6) County Road 19 — (64 Ft. of 12’ By 14’ Box Culvert) =§ .WO & rh

_Ow g
— (27 Ft. of 12’ By 14’ Box Culvert) =$ mOO




8) County Road 19 — (61 Ft. of 90” C.M. ARCH ) =$ O S

9) Inkrott Farm Drive — (16 Ft. of 48” Cast Iron) =$ WOO
10) Luebrecht Farm Drive — (6 Ft. Long 11 Ft. Span) =$ \.WO o aqt 4
11) Studebaker House Drive — (21 Ft. Long 10 Ft. Span) =§ @O &
12) County Road 19 — (64 Ft. of 84” C.M. ARCH) =$ m 60

13) Township Road R — (28 Ft. Long, 8’ By 10’ Box Culvert)=$ U,OO j50°

14) County Road 19 — (42 Ft. of 60” R.C.P) =$ %, 0O

OTAL QUOTE =3 &, /. 20,417.8
R. -
CONTRACTORS SIGNATURE: Ng\

appress:_ 11785 Co QIO ) pate: [2-6-| _
ARCk o) O 4350 L prows. 414572 6057

The completion date for this project is April 1st, 2020.
The County Engineer reserves the right to non-perform bidded items.
Please submit your quote to the Putnam County Engineer, 245 E Main St.,
Ottawa, Ohio 45875 in a sealed envelope marked “Quote on the John >m_a=m

#823” by 10:00 A.M. on December 9™, 2019. No bid bond or deposit required.

Note —

After the County Engineer awards the lowest and best quote, a contract will
need signed in the Engineer’s Office before starting. Once signed, there will be a
pre-construction meeting before excavation begins. — See “Information to
bidders for petition ditches™ sheet attached along with this quote.




John Askins #823

Union, Jackson, Jennings, Sugar Creek Townships, Putnam County Ohio
Maintenance Reconstruction

QUOTE FOR MAINTENANCE

I wish to submit the following quote for furnishing of all labor, materials and
equipment to complete the construction of the John Askins #823. This project
will be completed under the County Maintenance Program,

The work will include:

Item # 1 — Cleanout the open ditch to its original bottom
and grade to the full width of the existing
channel. (Equipment & Labor)

i w H Nx
14,918 lineal feet of excavation @ §$ # &% /ft. =§ \ ‘ T \V 8 T \

Item # 3 — Haul spoil from house lots and level all excavated material
along the ditch to a2 maximum depth of six inches.
(Equipment & Labor)

*All landowners who request no leveling must be in
contact with the Engineer’s Office before approval.

14,918 lineal feet of leveling @ $.0 |9 /ft

Item # 3 — Clearing consisting of removal of trees, brush,
stumps, snags and debris from the construction side only.
Isolated trees that would not impede the construction
May be saved upon landowner’s request. Pile all
Brush for landowner’s disposal. (Equipment & Labor)

Clearing & Piling Brush — Lump Sum

Item # 4 — Clean material out of all pipes and bridges.
Every pipe cleaning will have a separate lump
sum price. Final inspection and approval will be
upon the Engineer’s Office. (Equipment & Labor)

i A55
1) Wehri Farm Drive — (17 Ft. Long 11 Ft. Span) =§ A
o
2) County Road 19 — (56 Ft. of 87”x135” R.C.P) s b/l
3) Erhart Farm Drive — (28Ft. of 84” Boiler Pipe) 5 L&0

4) Kahle Farm Drive — (16 Ft. Long 8 Ft. Span)

5) Schulte Farm Drive — (26 Ft. Long 7°6” Span) =$ L/ o (U

— \v
6) County Road 19 — (64 Ft. of 12° By 14’ Box Culvert) =$ T 4

7) Township Read Q — (27 Ft. of 12° By 14’ Box Culvert) =$ J N F_




8) County Road 19 — (61 Ft. of 90” C.M. ARCH )

9) Inkrott Farm Drive — (16 Ft. of 48" Cast Iron)

10) Luebrecht Farm Drive — (6 Ft. Long 11 Ft. Span)

11) Studebaker House Drive — (21 Ft. Long 10 Ft. Span)

12) County Road 19 — (64 Ft. of 84” C.M. ARCH)

) o

13) Township Road R — (28 Ft. Long, 8’ By 10’ Box Culvert)=$__+4 (/ (

14) County Road 19 — (42 Ft. of 60” R.C.P) =

TOTAL QUOTE =$_| J; b/ ’ bx

CONTRACTORS SIGNATURE: nvwﬂ\%\ Tut\m\\\

apprEss: [4%85  Kd. T patE: |~ 5~/ \
O fhpnim Okl proNg: ! 19 - 115 :.,m 045

T

The completion date for this project is April 1st, 2020.

The County Engineer reserves the right to non-perform bidded items.
Please submit your quote to the Putnam County Engineer, 245 E Main St.,
Ottawa, Ohio 45875 in a sealed envelope marked “Quote on the John Askins
#823” by 10:00 A.M. on December 9%, 2019. No bid bond or deposit required.
Note —

After the County Engineer awards the lowest and best quote, a contract will
need signed in the Engineer’s Office before starting. Once signed, there will be a
pre-construction meeting before excavation begins. — See “Information to
bidders for petition ditches” sheet attached along with this quote.




John Askins #823
Union, Jackson, Jennings, Sugar Creek Townships, Putnam County Ohio
Maintenance Woooas.:ong

QUOTE FOR MAINTENANCE

I wish to submit the following quote for furnishing of all labor, materials and
equipment to complete the construction of the John Askins #823. This project
will be completed under the County Maintenance Program.

The work will include:

Item # 1 — Cleanout the open ditch to its original bottom
and grade to the full width of the existing
channel. (Equipment & Labor)

14,918 lineal feet of excavation @ $ 0,55 /ft. =3 m_ J04.90

Item # 3 — Haul spoil from house lots and level all excavated material
along the ditch to a maximum depth of six inches.
(Equipment & Labor)

*All landowners who request no leveling must be in
contact with the Engineer’s Office before approval.

14,918 lineal feet of leveling @ $ 0. 10 /f. =5 ],49).80

Item # 3 — Clearing consisting of removal of trees, brush,
stumps, snags and debris from the construction side only.
Isolated trees that would not impede the construction
May be saved upon landowner’s request. Pile all
Brush for landowner’s disposal. (Equipment & Labor)

.9
Clearing & Piling Brush — Lump Sum =$ WO 0.

Item # 4 — Clean material out of all pipes and bridges.
Every pipe cleaning will have a separate lump
sum price. Final inspection and approval will be
upon the Engineer’s Office. (Equipment & Labor)

-
e
1) Wehri Farm Drive — (17 Ft. Long 11 Ft. Span) -5 335.
.=
2) County Road 19 — (56 Ft. of 877x135” R.C.P) =5 3aS.
> 7
3) Erhart Farm Drive — (28Ft. of 84” Boiler Pipe) =$ w w ,w, y :m\_,;‘
>
4) Kahle Farm Drive — (16 Ft. Long 8 Ft. Span) =3 325 .
=
5) Schulte Farm Drive — (26 Ft. Long 7°6” Span) -5 3385,

\
6) County Road 19 — (64 Ft. of 12’ By 14” Box Culvert) = w m m.

V
7) Township Road Q — (27 Ft. of 12° By 14’ Box Culvert) =$ 5SS




“
8) County Road 19 — (61 Ft. of 90” C.M. ARCH ) -3 375.

9) Inkrott Farm Drive — (16 Ft. of 48 Cast Iron) =$ 3 %5,
=
10) Luebrecht Farm Drive — (6 Ft. Long 11 Ft. Span) =3 375.
>
11) Studebaker House Drive — (21 Ft. Long 10 Ft. Span) =$ 3 \wur. ﬁ F
Fr
12) County Road 19 — (64 Ft. of 84” C.M. ARCH) =3 WQ M. 2
o
13) Township Road R — (28 Ft. Long, 8’ By 10” Box Culvert)=$ w U,m,
\

14) County Road 19 — (42 Ft. of 60” R.C.P) -5 375,

TOTAL QUOTE =$ /Y 146.70
CONTRACTORS m_nz>ec@§\\\\u
\

ADDRESS: / 742 ST R |9 pate: [2-F-19
\WN\.. JepnineS, 6H pHONE: 4[] -R86- Q488

The completion date for this project is April 1st, 2020.

The County Engineer reserves the right to non-perform bidded items.
Please submit your quote to the Putnam County Engineer, 245 E Main St.,
Ottawa, Ohio 45875 in a sealed envelope marked “Quote on the John Askins
#823” by 10:00 A.M. on December 9™, 2019. No bid bond or deposit required.
Note —

After the County Engineer awards the lowest and best quote, a contract will
need signed in the Engineer’s Office before starting. Once signed, there will be a
pre-construction meeting before excavation begins. — See “Information to
bidders for petition ditches” sheet attached along with this quote.




John Askins #823

Union, Jackson, Jennings, Sugar Creek Townships, Putnam County Ohio
Maintenance Reconstruction

QUOTE FOR MAINTENANCE

1 wish to submit the following quote for furnishing of all labor, materials and
equipment to complete the construction of the John Askins #823. This project
will be completed under the County Maintenance Program.

The work will include:

Item # 1 — Cleanout the open ditch to its original bottom
and grade to the full width of the existing
channel. (Equipment & Labor)

. YO
14,918 lineal feet of excavation @ $ %IIW. /ft. =$ 5 318 02

Item # 3 — Haul spoil from house lots and level all excavated material
along the ditch to a maximum depth of six inches.
(Equipment & Labor)

*All landowners who request no leveling mwst be in
contact with the Engineer’s Office before approval.

14,918 lineal feet of leveling @ $_« Mm /. -3 S¥8.02

Item # 3 — Clearing consisting of removal of trees, brush,
stumps, snags and debris from the construction side only.
Isolated trees that would not impede the construction
May be saved upon landowner’s request. Pile all
Brush for landowner’s disposal. (Equipment & Labor)

Clearing & Piling Brush ~ Lump Sum =§ 2

Item # 4 — Clean material out of all pipes and bridges.
Every pipe cleaning will have a separate lump
sum price. Final inspection and approval will be
upon the Engineer’s Office. (Equipment & Labor)

1) Wehri Farm Drive — (17 Ft. Long 11 Ft. Span) = / , W@

2) County Road 19 - (56 Ft. of 87°x135” R.C.P) =$ 250

3) Erhart Farm Drive — (28Ft. of 84” Boiler Pipe) =$ \Nm\ o _Ro
4) Kahle Farm Drive — (16 Ft. Long 8 Ft. Span) =$ 250

5) Schulte Farm Drive - (26 Ft. Long 7°6” Span) =5 AGO

6) County Road 19 — (64 Ft. of 12’ By 14’ Box Culvert) =3 Nu\ww\,

\
7) Township Road Q - (27 Ft. of 12’ By 14’ Box Culverty =g (20 O




8) County Road 19 — (61 Ft. of 90" C.M. ARCH) =$ Qﬂrfv

O
9) Inkrott Farm Drive — (16 Ft. of 48” Cast Iron) =$ MN ﬁ

Y

10) Luebrecht Farm Drive — (6 Ft. Long 11 Ft. Span) =§ % 5o f

11) Studebaker House Drive — (21 Ft. Long 10 Ft. Span) =$ 250

12) County Road 19 — (64 Ft. of 84” C.M. ARCH) =$ 750

13) Township Road R — (28 Ft. Long, 8’ By 10’ Box Culvert)=$ [ 150

14) County Road 19 — (42 Ft. of 60” R.C.P) =5 X0

TOTAL QUOTE =$§ E

CONTRACTORS SIGNATURE: \m\ I bNMN (Precision iq Ox&ﬁ%@
ADDRESS:__(51( byverse [2yebn Rd  paTE: /2:9-19
Crocer it 0l Y5797 PHONE:_4/7 /5 -7305

The completion date for this project is April Ist, 2020,

The County Engineer rescrves the right to non-perform bidded itenis,
Please submit your quote to the Putnam County Engineer, 245 E Main St.,
Ottawa, Ohio 45875 in a sealed envelope marked “Quote on the John Askins
#823” by 10:00 A.M. on December 9™, 2019. No bid bond or deposit required.
Note —

After the County Engineer awards the lowest and best quote, a contract will
need signed in the Engineer’s Office before starting, Once signed, there will be a
pre-construction meeting before excavation begins. — See “Information to
bidders for petition ditches™ sheet attached along with this quote.




